
Silver coins become more expensive, so better silver companies 
 

 
 

The prohibition of differential taxation on the sale of silver coins will create more costs. 
 
Ten to eleven percent investors have to pay more when buying silver investment coins. 
This due to the decision of the Federal Ministry of Finance, which overturned the 
application of differential taxation, because the premium for the silver coins increases. 
The differential taxation virtually limits the value added tax to the dealer's margin. This 
previously applied to silver coins that came from countries outside the EU. These 
include, for example, the popular Maple Leaf silver coins or the silver Krugerrand. This 
is because until 2013, the concessionary VAT rate was applied to silver investment 



products in this country. When this came to an end in 2014, differential taxation came 
into being. Now the Federal Ministry of Finance has banned this type of taxation. The 
only exception is for so-called collector coins made of silver: they can still be offered 
with differential taxation in the future if their resale value exceeds two and a half times 
the actual metal value.  
 
This means that differential taxation is now only permitted for silver collector coins. The 
consequence is that the full VAT rate will apply to silver coins, so the premium will rise. 
It could become even more expensive, because silver coins are very popular, and the 
supply is not infinite. The situation is different for gold coins. The bullion coins, coins 
that are not collectibles, are exempt from VAT in the EU territory. Which gold coins 
these are can be found in a list issued annually by the Federal Ministry of Finance. 
Instead of investing in silver and gold coins, or even in addition, investors can get 
shares of silver and gold companies in the portfolio. Gold and silver in the projects own, 
for example, Vizsla Silver and Chesapeake Gold.  
 
Vizsla Silver - https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=bomWcs8Y8Vg - is pursuing the 
Panuco silver-gold project in Mexico. High-grade discoveries have already been made.  
 
Chesapeake Gold - https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=dinUyzlk36E - has its flagship 
project also in Mexico, the Metates project with gold, silver and zinc. 
 
Latest corporate information and press releases from Vizsla Silver (- 
https://www.resource-capital.ch/en/companies/vizsla-silver-corp/ -). 
 
 
 
In accordance with §34 WpHG I would like to point out that partners, authors and 
employees may hold shares in the respective companies addressed and thus a 
possible conflict of interest exists. No guarantee for the translation into English. Only 
the German version of this news is valid. 
 
Disclaimer: The information provided does not represent any form of recommendation 
or advice. Express reference is made to the risks in securities trading. No liability can 
be accepted for any damage arising from the use of this blog. I would like to point out 
that shares and especially warrant investments are always associated with risk. The 
total loss of the invested capital cannot be excluded. All information and sources are 
carefully researched. However, no guarantee is given for the correctness of all 
contents. Despite the greatest care, I expressly reserve the right to make errors, 
especially with regard to figures and prices. The information contained herein is taken 
from sources believed to be reliable, but in no way claims to be accurate or complete. 
Due to court decisions, the contents of linked external sites are also co-responsible 
(e.g. Landgericht Hamburg, in the decision of 12.05.1998 - 312 O 85/98), as long as 
there is no explicit dissociation from them. Despite careful control of the content, I do 
not assume liability for the content of linked external pages. The respective operators 
are exclusively responsible for their content. The disclaimer of Swiss Resource Capital 
AG also applies: https://www.resource-capital.ch/en/disclaimer/ 
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