
Energy transition and population growth require raw materials 
 

 
 

Raw materials such as tin for electrification and decarbonization and potash for good 
harvest results are in demand. 
 
Alongside lithium, cobalt and rare earths, tin is a metal that could become scarce in 
the foreseeable future due to its growing use. Most tin comes from developing and 
emerging countries, where mining is anything but sustainable. The supply of tin can 
already be classified as critical. Tin is mainly used in semiconductors. As an electronic 
solder, it connects circuit boards. The fact that demand for semiconductors is 
increasing is due to the growing areas of electromobility, artificial intelligence, the 
Internet of Things and consumer electronics. Soldering tapes are needed to connect 
solar modules. Both lithium-ion batteries and lead-acid batteries contain tin. 
 
As it could be worthwhile relying on tin as a metal, it is also worth taking a look at tin 
companies such as Tin One Resources - https://www.commodity-
tv.com/ondemand/companies/profil/tinone-resources-inc/ - Their tin projects are 
located in New South Wales and Tasmania and are extremely promising. 
 
Potash is a completely different raw material that is probably not often on the radar of 
investors but is nevertheless extremely promising for the future. The world's population 
is growing, and with it the need for food and the consumption of fertilizer for a good 
crop yield. There is widespread agreement among industry experts that demand for 
potash will increase. 
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In order to position themselves in time, potash companies should not be ignored. There 
is Millennial Potash - https://www.commodity-
tv.com/ondemand/companies/profil/millennial-potash-corp/ . The company's potash 
project is located in Gabon, Africa. Gabon supports the project. 
 
Current company information and press releases from Millennial Potash (- 
https://www.resource-capital.ch/en/companies/millennial-potash-corp/ -). 
 
 
 
In accordance with §34 WpHG I would like to point out that partners, authors and 
employees may hold shares in the respective companies addressed and thus a 
possible conflict of interest exists. No guarantee for the translation into English. Only 
the German version of this news is valid. 
 
Disclaimer: The information provided does not represent any form of recommendation 
or advice. Express reference is made to the risks in securities trading. No liability can 
be accepted for any damage arising from the use of this blog. I would like to point out 
that shares and especially warrant investments are always associated with risk. The 
total loss of the invested capital cannot be excluded. All information and sources are 
carefully researched. However, no guarantee is given for the correctness of all 
contents. Despite the greatest care, I expressly reserve the right to make errors, 
especially with regard to figures and prices. The information contained herein is taken 
from sources believed to be reliable, but in no way claims to be accurate or complete. 
Due to court decisions, the contents of linked external sites are also co-responsible 
(e.g. Landgericht Hamburg, in the decision of 12.05.1998 - 312 O 85/98), as long as 
there is no explicit dissociation from them. Despite careful control of the content, I do 
not assume liability for the content of linked external pages. The respective operators 
are exclusively responsible for their content. The disclaimer of Swiss Resource Capital 
AG also applies: https://www.resource-capital.ch/en/disclaimer/ 
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