
Gold, the last instance of value 
 

 
 

Zimbabwe's inflation is making the population poor. Zimbabwe is demonstrating what 
politicians and citizens can do: Invest in gold. 
 
At the end of July, the Central Bank of Zimbabwe announced the debut of its Mosi-oa-
Tunya gold coin. In this way, central bankers and politicians want to protect their 
citizens from rampant inflation. After all, only when demonetization is not a problem for 
investors can a savings culture be established. Saving is then once again the basis for 
prosperity and later consumption. It will be interesting to see how this kind of saving 
will be received by the citizens of Zimbabwe. In any case, the coin looks very nice.  
 
Mosi-ao-Tunya means "Thundering Smoke" and probably stands for the Victoria Falls, 
which are located in the Mosi-ao-Tunya National Park, which is in Zambia but on the 
border with Zimbabwe. These are also depicted on the coin. The weight is 33.93 
grams, and the purity is 22 carats (91.67%), which is exactly one ounce of pure gold. 
The price of the gold coin is the price of gold on the day of purchase for one ounce 
plus five percent minting and handling fees and can be settled in U.S. dollars or 
Zimbabwe dollars.  
 
"At the discretion of the gold coin holder, the bank or its agents will buy back the gold 
coins after a lock-up period of 180 days to promote a savings culture in the country," 
the Reserve Bank of Zimbabwe writes on its website. Investors can get the sale price 
back in U.S. dollars or Zimbabwe dollars. This Zimbabwean example shows that gold 
continues to be highly respected when it comes to wealth protection and a savings 
culture. Gold, after all, belongs in a balanced portfolio. In addition to a basic component 
of physical gold, investors can also consider the shares of gold companies. Caledonia 
Mining seems to be particularly topical at the moment. 
 
Caledonia digs gold out of the ground in Zimbabwe. The company successfully 
operates gold production at the Blanket gold mine. Caledonia Mining - 
https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=zvnfOE-2hXU - has just bought Bilboes Gold, thus 
adding the high-grade Bilboes Gold Project in Zimbabwe. 
 
Another example of a promising gold company that is already producing is 
OceanaGold - https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=ywsYsMG5sRc -. Its portfolio 
includes the Didipio mine in the Philippines, the Waihi and Macraes properties in New 
Zealand, and the Haile Gold Mine in the USA. 
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Current corporate information and press releases from Caledonia Mining (- 
https://www.resource-capital.ch/en/companies/caledonia-mining-corp/ -) and 
OceanaGold (- https://www.resource-capital.ch/en/companies/oceanagold-corp/ -). 
 
 
 
In accordance with §34 WpHG I would like to point out that partners, authors and 
employees may hold shares in the respective companies addressed and thus a 
possible conflict of interest exists. No guarantee for the translation into English. Only 
the German version of this news is valid. 
 
Disclaimer: The information provided does not represent any form of recommendation 
or advice. Express reference is made to the risks in securities trading. No liability can 
be accepted for any damage arising from the use of this blog. I would like to point out 
that shares and especially warrant investments are always associated with risk. The 
total loss of the invested capital cannot be excluded. All information and sources are 
carefully researched. However, no guarantee is given for the correctness of all 
contents. Despite the greatest care, I expressly reserve the right to make errors, 
especially with regard to figures and prices. The information contained herein is taken 
from sources believed to be reliable, but in no way claims to be accurate or complete. 
Due to court decisions, the contents of linked external sites are also co-responsible 
(e.g. Landgericht Hamburg, in the decision of 12.05.1998 - 312 O 85/98), as long as 
there is no explicit dissociation from them. Despite careful control of the content, I do 
not assume liability for the content of linked external pages. The respective operators 
are exclusively responsible for their content. The disclaimer of Swiss Resource Capital 
AG also applies: https://www.resource-capital.ch/en/disclaimer/ 
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