
Factors driving the gold price 
 

 
 

The time to enter the gold sector may be running out. Because higher prices are 
virtually pre-programmed. 
 
One reason for higher gold prices cited by gold experts is increasing de-dollarization. 
When looking at the economies of the G7 countries compared to the BRICS countries 
(Brazil, Russia, China, South Africa, India), it is striking that today, for the first time, the 
G7 countries (USA, Germany, Canada, France, Italy, Japan, Great Britain) contribute 
less to global GDP than the BRICS countries. Some see the end of the petrodollar 
coming and a new world emerging with the USA and China on the other side. Until 
now, the U.S. dollar was the world's reserve currency, and crude oil and commodities 
were traded in U.S. dollars. And commodities are now increasingly traded in non-dollar 
currencies. The most recent example was the agreement between China and France; 
natural gas purchases and sales are settled in yuan. Russia has turned to the yuan as 
a reserve currency since its invasion of Ukraine. Gold would be a beneficiary of this 
development. After all, gold is now at or near all-time highs in various currencies. 
 
Another point in favor of gold is the banking crisis. If the banks were to lend less now, 
this would slow down the economy, which would probably lead to new quantitative 
easing (QE) again in the medium term. Relations between Russia and China and the 
U.S. and its allies are also at an all-time low. The U.S. is facing Russia and China as 
if they were in a cold war. These geopolitical uncertainties should also strengthen gold. 
In addition to physical gold, exposure to gold mining stocks such as Skeena Resources 
or Tudor Gold is also advised. 
 
Skeena Resources - https://www.commodity-tv.com/play/skeena-resources-further-
drilling-at-eskay-deeps-in-2023-updated-resource-coming-soon/ - is working to 
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revitalize the Eskay Creek gold-silver mine in British Columbia, located in the Golden 
Triangle. 
 
Tudor Gold - https://www.commodity-tv.com/play/tudor-gold-ceo-ken-konkin-on-the-
updated-resource-estimate-and-2023-work-plans/ - owns the Treaty Creek Project in 
British Columbia, a large gold discovery with a very good mineral resource estimate. 
 
Current corporate information and press releases from Skeena Resources (- 
https://www.resource-capital.ch/en/companies/skeena-resources-ltd/ -). 
 
 
 
In accordance with §34 WpHG I would like to point out that partners, authors and 
employees may hold shares in the respective companies addressed and thus a 
possible conflict of interest exists. No guarantee for the translation into English. Only 
the German version of this news is valid. 
 
Disclaimer: The information provided does not represent any form of recommendation 
or advice. Express reference is made to the risks in securities trading. No liability can 
be accepted for any damage arising from the use of this blog. I would like to point out 
that shares and especially warrant investments are always associated with risk. The 
total loss of the invested capital cannot be excluded. All information and sources are 
carefully researched. However, no guarantee is given for the correctness of all 
contents. Despite the greatest care, I expressly reserve the right to make errors, 
especially with regard to figures and prices. The information contained herein is taken 
from sources believed to be reliable, but in no way claims to be accurate or complete. 
Due to court decisions, the contents of linked external sites are also co-responsible 
(e.g. Landgericht Hamburg, in the decision of 12.05.1998 - 312 O 85/98), as long as 
there is no explicit dissociation from them. Despite careful control of the content, I do 
not assume liability for the content of linked external pages. The respective operators 
are exclusively responsible for their content. The disclaimer of Swiss Resource Capital 
AG also applies: https://www.resource-capital.ch/en/disclaimer/ 
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