
What tin has to do with food 
 

 
 

In the past, tin was used in the field of tableware production. Today it is used, among 
other things, for tinning canned food. 
 
Old tin cups, for example, everyone knows. Food-safe canned goods are still provided 
with tin today. In addition, tin is used in the field of electro-soldering in electronics or in 
medicine. From a historical point of view, tin was first and foremost used as an 
admixture to copper for the production of bronze. Tin is also in demand as a stabilizer 
for PVC and is used in optics in LCD screens. Thus, tin is present, albeit hidden, in 
everyday appliances. The supply of tin has gone up, by 11 percent last year according 
to the International Tin Association, but there is still talk of shortages. This is especially 
true in the electronics sector, which accounts for most of the demand. So, the market 
remains tight, and tin remains an interesting commodity for investors. A tin price of 
US$40,000 per ton is expected for the end of the year. Besides Indonesia, the world's 
largest tin exporting country, there is also tin in Kazakhstan. This is namely at Tin One 
Mining, an exploration and development company that is working to develop the 
Syrymbet tin deposit, the largest undeveloped tin deposit in Kazakhstan. The goal is 
to open the only tin production facility in Central Asia. 
 
Tin in cans is thus used for the preservation and conservation of food. For this aspect, 
albeit with completely different means, EnWave - 
https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=iIvbLN2QNGo - is working. With its breakthrough 
REV™ technology, EnWave has created new and innovative applications for food 
manufacturers. The patented drying method is already used by more than 50 
companies in more than 20 countries. Cannabis products and pharmaceutical products 
also use EnWaves technology. 
 
Latest corporate information and press releases from EnWave (- https://www.resource-
capital.ch/en/companies/enwave-corp/ -). 
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In accordance with §34 WpHG I would like to point out that partners, authors and 
employees may hold shares in the respective companies addressed and thus a 
possible conflict of interest exists. No guarantee for the translation into English. Only 
the German version of this news is valid. 
 
Disclaimer: The information provided does not represent any form of recommendation 
or advice. Express reference is made to the risks in securities trading. No liability can 
be accepted for any damage arising from the use of this blog. I would like to point out 
that shares and especially warrant investments are always associated with risk. The 
total loss of the invested capital cannot be excluded. All information and sources are 
carefully researched. However, no guarantee is given for the correctness of all 
contents. Despite the greatest care, I expressly reserve the right to make errors, 
especially with regard to figures and prices. The information contained herein is taken 
from sources believed to be reliable, but in no way claims to be accurate or complete. 
Due to court decisions, the contents of linked external sites are also co-responsible 
(e.g. Landgericht Hamburg, in the decision of 12.05.1998 - 312 O 85/98), as long as 
there is no explicit dissociation from them. Despite careful control of the content, I do 
not assume liability for the content of linked external pages. The respective operators 
are exclusively responsible for their content. The disclaimer of Swiss Resource Capital 
AG also applies: https://www.resource-capital.ch/en/disclaimer/ 
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